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FOI 186/20/21  

Security Investigation Unit Investigations – 01 Jan 20 to 13 Nov 20 

Lost, missing or stolen Military equipment that the Department of Defence has investigated the Outcome. Please also include details of whether they were 
retrieved/found/written off or finalised and the cost. 

Timeframe: since 1 January, 2020. 

Item Lost/Missing or Stolen Retrieved/Found/Written off or finalised Estimated Cost of item 
INV-DSA01-SIU-2020-05 Aircraft parts Lost Finalised / Retrieved Unknown at this time 

INV-DSA01-SIU-2020-06 Aircraft parts Lost Finalised / Retrieved Unknown at this time 

INV-DSA01-SIU-2020-09 Laptops Stolen Finalised / Written-Off $84,051 (ex GST) 
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Item Lost/Missing or Stolen Retrieved/Found/Wri
tten off or finalised 

Estimated Cost of 
item 

INV-JMP01-GDBNE-2020-2 – Recovery of 
items 
Combat Body Armour  
Webbing 
Knee pads 

Found Written off $400.00 

INV-JMP01-GDADE-2020-2 – Sale of 
military uniform 
1X DPCU 
1X DPCU 
1X DPCU 

Theft Not recovered  
 
$113.35 
$55.00 
$55.00 
 

INV-JMP01-GDCAN-2020-22 – Theft 
1x box of rations 10 in box 
1x box of rations 10 in box 
1X Box message notebooks 128 in box 
1x box field notebooks 84 in box 
1x box hexamine 15 in box 
 

Theft Recovered Not recorded 

INV-JMP01-GDDWN-2020-17 – Theft 
3x Back packs and accessories 
Defence documents 
52x pouches 
Webbing 
11x Military equip  

Theft Not recovered  
 
$719.59 
 
 
$550.77 
$15045 
$805.59 

INV-JMP01-GDSYD-2020-2 – Theft 
11x Solkoa survival kits  
 

Theft Not recovered $3322.00 

INV-JMP01-GDADE-2020-1 
1x GP Boots 
2x Echelon bag 
1x Webbing  
4x Military clothing 
2XAMCU 

Theft Not recovered  
 
$1.00 
$1.00 
$97.53 
$65.64 
$332.00 

INV-ADF01-DWN-2020-15 - Loss 
3x MRUAS (aka Drones) 

Loss Not recovered $8,100.00 

INV-JMP01-GDDWN-2020-5 – loss 
1x Smoke grenade 

Loss Recovered Not recorded 

INV-ADF01-PTH—2020-33 – Loss 
2x Ballistic plates 

Loss Not recovered Not recorded 

INV-ADF01-PTH-2020-21- Loss 
1x Infrared laser 

Loss Not recovered Not recorded 

 

Joint Military Police Investigations – 1 Jan 20 to 11 Nov 20 
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Fraud Control and Investigations Branch Investigations – 1 Jan 20 to 11 Nov 20 

Item Lost/Missing or Stolen Retrieved/Found/Written off 
or finalised 

Estimated Cost of 
item 

INV-IGD01-DI-2020-2 
 
Portable radio 

Stolen Recovered $5,549.50 

INV-IGD01-RA-2020-10  
 
Copper switchboard bus bars 

Stolen Written off 
 

$1,700 

INV-IGD01-RA-2020-58 
 
Foodstuffs 

Stolen Written off Not recorded 

 


