
DEFENCE FORCE REMUNERATION TRIBUNAL

DETERMINATION NO. 10 OF 2001

PARATROOPER ALLOWANCE –
HIGH ALTITUDE PARACHUTE OPERATIONS

The Defence Force Remuneration Tribunal makes the following Determination under section 58H of the
Defence Act 1903:

Commencement

1.1 Clause 4 is to be taken to have commenced on 1 March 2001.

1.2 The remaining provisions are to be taken to have commenced on 1 February 2001.

Amendment

2. Determination No. 2 of 2001, Paratrooper Allowance, as amended, is amended as set out in this
Determination.

New clause 5A

3. After clause 5, insert:

Additional allowance for HAPO descent

5A.1 This clause applies to a member who is a paratrooper and who:

(a) completes a HAPO descent; or

(b) if the member does not complete a HAPO descent — is required to use, and uses,
supplementary oxygen in the course of a HAPO; or

(c) is responsible for management of the oxygen distribution console within the aircraft for the
members involved in a HAPO.

5A.2 The member is entitled to an additional amount of Paratrooper Allowance of:

(a) for a member to whom paragraph 5A.1(a) applies — $220; and

(b) otherwise — $110.

5A.3 If the member has an entitlement to more than 1 amount under subclause 5A.2 on a day, the
member is entitled to 1 amount only on that day, being (if applicable) the higher amount.



Clause 5A (Additional allowance for HAPO descent)

4.1 Paragraph 5A.2(a):

Omit “$220”, substitute “$224.40”.

4.2 Paragraph 5A.2(b):

Omit “$110”, substitute “$112.20”.

Dated twenty ninth day of May two thousand and one.

His Honour Judge F K Cawthorne .................................................................
President

The Honourable Deputy President P L Leary .................................................................
Member

Air Vice Marshal F D Cox AO (Retd) .................................................................
Member


