b

JﬂJKUSTgﬁlJAFér

DEFENCE DETERMINATION 1996/4

DETERMINATION UNDER THE DEFENCE ACT 1903

I, THOMAS FISHER, Acting First Assistant Secretary, Government

Authorities and Defence Division, Department of Industrial

Relations, acting under a delegation made by the Minister for
Industrial Relations under Defence Force Regulation 72A, make

the following Determination under section 58B of the Defence

Act 1803,

Dated 23 February 1996

T. FISHER
Acting First Assistant Secretary

Government Authorities and Defence Division

Department of Industrial Relations

1. Citation
1.1 This Determination may be cited as Defence
Determination 1996/4.

2. Commencement

2.1 This Determination commences on 7 March 1886,

3. Amendment

3.1 Determination 2501, Charge for Rations and Quarters,

amended!, is amended as set out in this Determination.

4. Clause 6 (Charge for Rations and Quarters)
4.1 Item i, ¢olumn 3:
Delete "$9.25", substitute "$9.45".

4.2 Item 2, column 3:
Delete "$11.45", substitute "$11.65".

4.3 Item 3, column 3:
Delete "$12.35", substitute "$12.55".

as

{refdl1i] Printed in Australin by A J. Law, Commonweahn Govammant Printar, Canbemra




Note:

Determination 2501 was made by Determination 97 of 1984
and has been amended by Determination Nos. 112 of 1984;
35 and 69 of 1985; 37 and 102 of 1986; 20, 39 and 46 of
1987; 7, 17, 21, 54, 65 and 80 of 1988; 58, 125 and 191
of 1989; 79, 103 and 176 of 199%0; 76, 103 and 118 of
1991; 21 and 44 of 1992; 33 of 1993 and 44 of 1994; 12,
25, 27 and 31 of 1995. The Determination has also been
amended by Determination Nes. 1 and 2 of 1988 made
under section 58H.




EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM
DEFENCE DETERMINATION 1996/4

Defence Act 1903

Determination 2501, Charge for Rations and Quarters, provides
for charges to members for rations and quarters when members
are provided with Service accommodation and meals.

This Determination provides for increased charges to apply
from the beginning of the first pay period after
1 March 1996, ie 7 March 1996,

These rates are adjusted bi-annually in September and March,
based on price movements in the Food Group Index of the
Consumer Price Index for the 6 months ending 31 December and
30 June respectively. The changes made by this Determination
reflect price movements to December 1895.

Authority: Section 58B of the
Defence Act 1803





