JHJEUSTgAJJAFé'

DEFENCE DETERMINATION 1994/44

DETERMINATION UNDER THE DEFENCE ACT 1903

I, MERYL ANNETTE STANTON, First Assigtant Secretary,
Governmont Authorities and Defence Division, Department of
Industrial Relations, acting under a delegation made by the
Minister for Industrial Relations under Defence Force
Regulation 72A, make the following Determination under section
58B of the Defence Act 1503.

Dated 29 ‘September 1994

M. STANTON

First Assistant Secretary

Government Authorities and Defence Division
Department of Industrial Relations

PART A - Preliminary

1. Citation .
1.1' This Determination may be cited as Defence Determination

1994/44.

2. Commencement
2.1 Parts B, € and D are to be taken to have commenced on

1 September 1994.

2.2 Parts E, F and G commence on the first day of the pay
period commencing on or after the date of signature.

[refBBO] Printad In Australa by A. J. Law, Commonwsalth Goverryment Printer, Canberma




PART B ~ Amendmont of Datermination 499

3. Amendment
3.1 Determination 499, Attendance Allowance, as amended!, is
amended as set out in this Part.

4. Clause 3 (Attendance nllowance)
4.1 Paragraph 3(a):
Delete "$3.00", substitute "$3.10".

4.2 Paragraph 3(b}:
Delete "$5.45", substitute "$5.60".

4.3 Paragraph 3i{c):
Delete "$7.20", substitute "$7.40".

4.4 Paragraph 3(d):
Delete "$10.00", substitute "$10.25".

PART € - Amendment of Determination 510

5. Amendment
5.1 Determination 510, Child Care Reimbursement Allowance,
as amended?, is amended as set out in this Part.

6. Clause 7 (Amount of Allowance)
6.1 Paragraph 7(b):
Delete "$33,45", substitute "$34,95",

PART D - Amendment of Determination 511

1. Amendment
7.1 Determination 511, Extra Tuition Allowance, as amended?,
is amended as set out in this Part.

B. Clause 5 (Amount of Allowanca)
8.1 Paragraph 5(b):
Delete "$66.00", substitute "5$68.90".

PART E - Amendment of Determination 601

9. Amendment
9.1 Determination 601, Uniform Maintenance Allowance, as
amended4, 1is amended as set out in this Part.

10. Schedule (Rates of Uniform Maintenance Allowance)
10.1 1Item 1, column 3:
Delete "$396", substitute "$390".

10.2 Item 2, column 3:
_ Delete “$476", substitute "$469",

10.3 Item 3, column 3:
Delete "3644", substitute "$634".




PART F - Amendment of Detaermination 2501

11. Amendment
11.1 Determination 2501, Charge for Rations and Quarters, as
amended5, is amended as set out in this Part.

12. Clause 6 (Charge for Rations and Quarters)
12.1 Item 1, column 3:
Delete "$8.80", substitute "$8.90".

12.2 1Item 2, column 3:
Delete "510.85", substitute "$11,00".

12.3 Item 3, column 3:
Delete "$11.70", substitute "$11.85".

PART G - Amendment of Defence Determination 1991/13

13. Amendment
13.1 Defence Determination 1991/13, as amended$, is amended as
set out in this Part.

14. Clause 4 (Aide-de-Camp Allowance)
14.1 Subclause 4.3:
Delete "column 2", substitute "column 3 of Part A".

14.2 Subclause 4.3:
Delete "in column 1".

15. Clause 6 (Spouse of the Military Secretary/Coemptroller)
15.1 Paragraph 6.2(a):
Delete "column 2", substitute "column 3".

16. Schedule
l16.1 Delete the Schedule, substitute the schedule set out in
the Attachment.

Notes

i, Determination 45% was made by Determination 1B of 1981 and has been amended by
Determination Nos. 39 of 1981; 24 of 1982; 48 and 112 of 1984s; 69 of 1985; 49 of
19867 5 and 86 of 1987; 17 and BO of 1968; 191 of 1989:;.35 and 176 of 1990; 118 of
1991; 21 and 44 of 1992 and 33 of 1693,

2. Determination 510 was made by Determination 2 of 1988 and has been smended by
betermination Nos. 24, 65 and 80 of 19B8; 1%1 of 1989; 176 of 15%0:; 118 of 1991; 44
of 1992 and 33 of 1993,

3. Determination 511, as amended to date, For previous amendments see Note to
Determination 8 of 1994 and see also Determination Nos. B and 42 of 1594,

4. Determination 601 was made by Determination 10 of 1981 and has been amended by
. Determination Nos, 25, 35, 52 and 60 fo 1961y 1i, 26 and 50 fo 1982; 20 and 27 of
1983; & and 112 of 1984; 4 and 69 of 1985; 5 of 1587; &4 and 80 of 19688; 207 of 19%89:
177 of 1990; 118 of 198%1; 21 and 44 of 1992 and 32 and 33 of 1993.

5. Determination 2501 was made by Determination 97 of 1984 and has been amended by
Determination Nes. 112 of 1984:; 35 and 69 of 1985; 37 and 102 of 1986; 20, 39 and 46
. of 1987; 7, 17, 2%, 54, 65 and BO of 1988; 58, 125 and 191 of 1989; 79, 103 and 176
of 1990; 76, 103 and 118 of 1991; 21 and ¢4 of 1952 and 33 of 1993. The
Determination has also been amended by Determinaticon Nos., 1 and 2 of 1988 made under
section 58H.

6. Determination 13 of 1991 has been amended by Determination No. 118 of 1991; 4¢ of
1992 and 33 of 19893,




ATTACHMENT



SCHEDULE

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Maximam

Item Dascription Amount
PART A
1, Military Secretary/Comptroller .

to the Governor-General 5440
2. Aide-de-camp to the Governor-General 4356
3. Aide-de-camp for an overseas visiting

dignitary appointed by the Chief of

the Defence Force 2178
q. Other position designated aide-de-camp

by the Chief of the Defence Force 1089
PART B
1. Dresses and other items of female

attire 1502
2. Suits and other items of male attire 697




EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM
DEFENCE DETERMINATION 1994/44

bDefence Act 1903

This Determination amends Determinations:

499 - Attendance Allowance

510 - Child Care Reimbursement Allowance
511 - Extra Tuition Allowance

601 - Uniform Maintenance Allowance

2501 - Charge for Rations and Quarters
1991/13 - ARide-de-Camp Allowance.

Parts B, C and D of this Determination provide for the payment
to members of the Australian Defence Force (ADF) of increased
rates of Attendance Allowance (+2.8%), Child Care
Reimbursement Allowance (+4.4%) and Extra Tuition

Allowance {+4.4%).

Parts E and G decrease rates of payment to members for Uniform
Maintenance Allowance and ARide-de-Camp Allowance respectively
{(both -1.6%).

Part F provides for increased charges (+1.4%) to members for
rations and quarters when members are provided with Serv1ce
accommodation and meals.

These rates are adjusted annually in September, based on price
movements in the relevant components of the Consumer Price
Index for the year ending 30 June. The changes made by this
Determination reflect price movements to June 19%4. The
adjustments in Parts E, F and G which have the effect of
reducing entitlements have been introduced prospectively.

The retrospective application of this Determination does not
affect the rights of a person (other than the Commonwealth) in
a manner prejudicial to that person, nor does it impose any
liability on such person.

Authority: Section 58B of the
Defence Act 1803





